
BARC in BRIEF 
FOR YOUR INFORMATION      BY: VE3COJ

Welcome  

Welcome to BARC in BRIEF. This monthly notice is to 
keep you informed of events and information about 
your club and its activities. If you have information of 
interest, about an amateur radio activity, email it to the 
President for possible publication. 

General Meeting 

The BARC General meeting is November 9th , and will 
be at East Plains United Church 375 Plains Rd E, 
Burlington, ON. The Meeting  starts at 7pm. Please use 
the East side of the building for parking.

Website 

The barc website is currently up to date. A Photo 
Gallery has been added and will be updated as 
necessary. The gallery is in the construction stage at 
this time. Photos of club events are most welcome.

Contesting 

Hugh, VE3AYR, Rod VE3ISO and Sean VE3XYY are 3 of 
our members who have a real interest in contesting, and 
they would like to share their enjoyment of the activity 
with you. Feel free to contact them and have an fun 
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       Recycle Table 

We ALL have radio/electronic “stuff” that we want to 
get rid of! Here’s an opportunity do do just that. There 
will be a table at each General Meeting to move our 
“stuff” to someone else for FREE.  

If you need to sell it, then put a price on it with your 
callsign. 

Program for November 9 

Hugh, VE3AYR will give us a presentation on VE100VIMY 

This was the Commemorative Amateur Radio Special 
Event held at Vimy Ridge in April of this year. Hugh 
participated in the event and has an interesting “first 
person” account of the activities! 

Hackspace 

Tuesday evenings at 7pm join Jason VA3VNA for an 
evening of interests, construction projects and ideas. 
Projects include antennas, antenna analyzer, DMR 
information, and hands on. Got questions? This is the 
place to find answers. Check out some photos.

       BARC Christmas Banquet 

Our Annual Christmas Banquet will be held on 
December 7 at the Tyandaga Golf Club,  

1265 Tyandaga Park Dr, Burlington. 

6:30 PM Cocktails and Fellowship. 

Tickets: $40. ea.    Pay at the door 

Order your tickets from Mary McCully  

by phone: 905-333-0826  

or email: mlmccully@sympatico.ca. 
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